G.NARAYANAMMA INSTITUTE oF TECHNOLOGY& SCIENCE

Payment Vouchor
—

Staff Development A/C

Through :

SBI A/C.NO.521 19331658
On Account of :

ch.no.132632 issued to mr.A.Chandrg
Shaker, Asst.prof, ETM towards FDP (Rs.

750/-) and reg. fe e for attending webinar on

Business Opportunities in Soya from 1 8.11to
21.11.2020 ( Rs.295/.)

Amount (in words) ;

Indian Rupees One Thousand Forty Five Only

_/) I o
M k,i/ . %"/ (r\,d\*' sht
. ) - L6 .
Receiver's Signatyre ™ QRN e W Officer Authoriseq‘ﬁfgnamm O 7-2
ﬂ * o o %
<. ,\@gg (P 3 Institule Fﬁ Nq:qy\n‘w:{n‘mm Instityta of far
(t‘ e m@)"wﬁ Science (1w v, 0n E\Hf”U’GgJ,V ‘k{ QLence (for Women)
- i (AUTONOMO s 1o AUTONON
(Ehaikpg;‘ Hyderabac! -1y 10a.5haikpe

[,H)’lft‘r.lll.]d 500 104,

gy

150/



L]

05/02/2021
From:-

A. Chandra Shaker, Emp. ID - 17040,
Asst, Professor,

ETE Department,

GNITS . S
./
Vv
7/

Through Proper Channel

To,

The Principal, :

GNITS,

Shaikpet, \@,\’ d
Hyderabad. /
Respected Sir, /

Subject: - Request for approval of “FDP on OBE” Fee of Rs.750/-

f/:;;"" -

i

I, A. Chandra Shaker ( Employee ID:- 17040) working as Assistant Professor in ETE Department
had attended a 10 day online FDP on “Academic Quality Assurance through Outcome Based Education”
organized by E&ICT Academy, NIT Warangal and GNITS from 08-07-2020 to 18-07-2020 (Copy
attached) and paid a fee of Rs.1250/-(Copy attached) for the same, NIT Warangal had returned back an
amount of Rs.500/-,

So, | would request you to grant me the remaining amount of Rs.750/-.

4/0' Thanking you,

~ F QQLL/%Q&,/// YoursSmcerely
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05/02/2021

From:-

A. Chandra Shaker, Emp. ID - 17040,
Asst. Professor,

ETE Department,

GNITS

Through Proper Channel

To,

The Principal,
GNITS,
Shaikpet,
Hyderabad.

Respected Sir,

Subject: - Request for approval of EDC “Webinar on Soya” Fee of Rs.295/-

/

[

I, A. Chandra Shaker (Employee ID:- 17040) working as Assistant Professor in ETE Department
had attended a 3 day webinar on “Business Opportunities in Soya - Empowering women in Food
Sector” organized by AIC ALEAP WEHUB from 18-11-2020 to 20-11-2020. (Copy attached) and paid a

fee amount of Rs.295/-(Copy attached) for the same.

So, would request you to grant me the amount of Rs.295/-.

Thanking you,

Yours Sincerely
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